
Massage Therapist, Diploma – 37 credits 
Program Area:  Health   (Fall 2023) 

***REMEMBER TO REGISTER EARLY*** 

Program Description 
The Massage Therapist Program prepares the 
graduate for a career in massage. The graduate 
therapist is able to conduct a thorough 
assessment of clients, create a treatment plan, 
implement the treatment plan, and observe the 
client’s response to the treatment. Therapeutic 
massage, as well as many specialty techniques 
are used. Documentation is done to record 
session information, and treatment’s effects on 
the body. Career development, including the 
creation of a business plan, is taught. Therapists 
may find opportunities to work in a variety of 
settings, from running their own business, to 
working in wellness/fitness centers, clinical 
environments, and spas. 

Program Outcomes 
• Knowledge and ability to observe and

assess the client’s musculoskeletal, 
connective tissue and lymphatic systems 

• Propose and implement a treatment plan
based on the client’s goals 

• Observe and document the client’s response
to the treatment 

• Produce a comprehensive personalized
business plan for starting, managing and 
promoting a massage practice  

• Demonstrate comfort with ethical issues of
running a business and massage as a
touch-based profession

• Demonstrate the ability to adapt massage
techniques to pregnant, infant, athletic, and
medically fragile populations

• Apply hot stone, lymphatic facilitation,
neuromuscular retraining, and Reflexology
techniques

• Demonstrate self-awareness and the
theoretical understanding of how to prevent
therapist injury and burnout

• Recognize massage contraindications and
cautions

• Complete 780 hours of instruction, 112 of
which are Supervised Clinical practice
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Qualified applicants should be aware that program class sizes are limited, which may delay acceptance into the 
program. 
  
You may be required to complete additional (or less) coursework, dependent upon the results of your 


